
EATON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2016 DUST CONTROL BID TAB

05/10/2016
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NORTHEAST 75.18 $360.00 $27,064.80 3130 $498.39 $37,468.96 2694 $900.00 $67,662.00 1500 No Bid N/A N/A

NORTHWEST 138.22 $360.00 $49,759.20 3130 $498.39 $68,887.47 2694 $900.00 $124,398.00 1500 No Bid N/A N/A

SOUTHEAST 129.41 $360.00 $46,587.60 3130 $498.39 $64,496.65 2694 $900.00 $116,469.00 1500 No Bid N/A N/A

SOUTHWEST 150.15 $360.00 $54,054.00 3130 $498.39 $74,833.26 2694 $900.00 $135,135.00 1500 No Bid N/A N/A

GREAT LAKES CHLORIDE, INC.MICHIGAN MINERAL RESOURCES LLC MICHIGAN CHLORIDE SALES LLC S & M LIQUID TIRE FILL


