

**EATON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2016 ROAD AGGREGATE BID TABULATION**

2016 SEALCOAT AGGREGATE BIDS

05/10/2016

	28B				29A				34CS				ALTERNATE			
	C&D Hughes	Gale Briggs	Carr Bros	Crandel Bros	C&D Hughes	Gale Briggs	Carr Bros	Crandel Bros	C&D Hughes	Gale Briggs	Carr Bros	Crandel Bros	C&D Hughes	Gale Briggs	Carr Bros	Crandel Bros
	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton	\$ per Ton
SOUTHWEST																
Charlotte Garage	\$ 10.50	\$ 12.50	\$ 13.50	\$ 15.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Village of Bellevue	\$ 11.35	\$ 12.50	\$ 13.50	\$ 15.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Cronk Pit	\$ 11.35	\$ 12.50	\$ 13.50	\$ 15.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Stine Pit	\$ 11.35	\$ 12.50	\$ 13.50	\$ 15.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NORTHWEST																
Vermontville Garage	\$ 10.05	\$ 12.00	\$ 16.50	\$ 15.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.75	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
NORTHEAST																
Delta Garage	\$ 12.75	\$ 13.50	\$ 15.50	\$ 15.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.50	No Bid	No Bid
Hull Pit	\$ 12.00	\$ 13.50	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.50	No Bid	No Bid
SOUTH EAST																
Barnes Pit	\$ 12.75	\$ 13.75	\$ 14.00	\$ 15.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.75	No Bid	No Bid
Five Point Pit	\$ 12.25	\$ 13.75	\$ 14.00	\$ 15.90	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 16.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 13.75	No Bid	No Bid

3/8
PEASTONE
NATURAL
AGG

Natural Agg. -
no crushed Natural Agg. NATURAL NATURAL

NATURAL

Gale Briggs alternate is 3/8" Peastone