

**ASPHALT EMULSION
 BID TABULATION
 14-Mar-17**

Type of Emulsion	Michigan Paving & Materials Co.		Base Asphalt Designation or Performance Grade No.
	Bid Unit Price Job Site	Bid Unit Price Charlotte	
HFRS-2M	\$ 1.6000	\$ 1.7500	PG 52-28
CRS-2M	\$ 1.6000	\$ 1.7500	PG 52-28
CSS-1H	No Bid	No Bid	
CSS-1H/Diluted	\$ 1.3500	\$ 1.5000	PG 64-22
CRS-2M/Diluted	No Bid	No Bid	
Fast Set Fog Seal	\$ 1.2800	\$ 1.4300	PG 64-22
	Min Load	4,000	
	Max Load	10,000	

Bit-Mat Products of Michigan			Base Asphalt Designation or Performance Grade No.
Bid Unit Price Job Site	Bid Unit Price Charlotte		
\$ 1.8000	\$ 1.9000		PG 58-28
\$ 2.6000	\$ 2.7000		PG 58-28
No Bid	No Bid		
No Bid	No Bid		
No Bid	No Bid		
\$ 1.4200	\$ 1.5200		PG 58-28
Min Load	9,000		
Max Load	10,000		
Returned Freight: 1 1/2 Outbound Rate Min. Charge \$200			

Asphalt Materials, Inc.			Base Asphalt Designation or Performance Grade No.
Bid Unit Price Job Site	Bid Unit Price Charlotte		
\$ 1.8300	\$ 1.9500		120/130 PEN
\$ 1.8800	\$ 2.0500		120/130 PEN
\$ 2.1800	\$ 2.2500		60/80 PEN
\$ 1.4800	\$ 1.5500		60/80 PEN
\$ 1.4800	\$ 1.5500		120/130 PEN
\$ 1.4800	\$ 1.5500		60/80 PEN
Min Load	5,400		
Max Load	9,600		
1 1/2 Times return freight			