

**ASPHALT EMULSION
 BID TABULATION
 FEBRUARY 13, 2018**

	Michigan Paving & Materials Co.		Asphalt Materials, Inc.		Bit-Mat Products of Michigan	
	Job Site	Charlotte	Job Site	Charlotte	Job Site	Charlotte
HFRS-2M	\$ 1.7900	\$ 1.9400	\$ 2.0599	\$ 2.1400	\$ 1.9200	\$ 2.0400
CRS-2M	\$ 1.7900	\$ 1.9400	\$ 2.1099	\$ 2.1900	\$ 1.9200	\$ 2.0400
CSS-1H	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 2.2099	\$ 2.2900	No Bid	No Bid
CSS-1H/Diluted for Fog Seal	\$ 1.2500	\$ 1.4000	\$ 1.6599	\$ 1.7400	No Bid	No Bid
CRS-2M/Diluted for Fog Seal	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.7099	\$ 1.7900	No Bid	No Bid
Fast Set Fog Seal	\$ 1.2500	\$ 1.4000	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.3500	\$ 1.4700