

Eaton County Road Commission

BID TABULATION FOR GRADER BLADES

MAY 22, 2018

Type A: Flame Hardened Steel Blade 3/4"x8"x6' (Single Bevel Curve)
 Type B: Flame Hardened Steel Blade 3/4"x8"x7' (Single Bevel Curve)
 Type C: Flame Hardened Steel Blade – Serrated 3/4"x8"x6' (Single Bevel Curve)
 Type D: Flame Hardened Steel Blade – Serrated 3/4"x8"x7' (Single Bevel Curve)
 Type E: Flame Hardened Steel Blade - Serrated 5/8" x 7/8" x 8" x 6' (Double Bevel Curve)

Bidder	Shults Equipment, Inc.		Winter Equipment Co.		St. Regis Culvert, Inc.		Heights Truck Equipment		Truck & Trailer Specialties	
Brand Name	Bucyrus Blades		Black Cat Blades		Valley Blades		Black Cat Wear Parts		ESCO/Bucyrus Blades	
Description	Weight Per Foot	Unit Price Per Foot	Weight Per Foot	Unit Price Per Foot	Weight Per Foot	Unit Price Per Foot	Weight Per Foot	Unit Price Per Foot	Weight Per Foot	Unit Price Per Foot
Type A	19.17	14.67	18.30	13.77	19.30	15.37	18.33	11.74	19.17	15.25
Type B	19.17	14.67	18.43	13.77	19.30	15.37	18.43	11.74	19.14	15.25
Type C	15.34	11.15	15.16	13.53	15.30	20.68	15.17	13.99	15.33	15.35
Type D	15.34	16.14	17.60	15.78	15.30	20.68	15.14	13.99	15.29	16.94
Type E	19.67	17.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	19.67	18.10