

**EATON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2019 DUST CONTROL BID TAB**

01/07/2019

AREA	MILES	<u>IVY MMR LLC</u>			<u>MICHIGAN CHLORIDE SALES LLC</u>			<u>CHLORIDE SOLUTIONS, LLC</u>		
		UNIT PRICE PER MILE	TOTAL PRICE	APPLICATION RATE	UNIT PRICE PER MILE	TOTAL PRICE	APPLICATION RATE	UNIT PRICE PER MILE	TOTAL PRICE	APPLICATION RATE
NORTHEAST	75.25	\$447.50	\$33,674.38	2500	No bid	#VALUE!		\$547.50	\$41,199.38	1500
NORTHWEST	138.21	\$447.50	\$61,848.98	2500	No bid	#VALUE!		\$547.50	\$75,669.98	1500
SOUTHEAST	129.45	\$437.50	\$56,634.38	2500	No bid	#VALUE!		\$547.50	\$70,873.88	1500
SOUTHWEST	150.64	\$437.50	\$65,905.00	2500	No bid	#VALUE!		\$547.50	\$82,475.40	1500
Price at Wellhead		\$0.085 per gallon Olivet, MI			\$0.085 per gallon St. Louis, MI			\$0.219 per gallon North Branch & Fowlerville		