EATON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2022 DUST CONTROL BID TAB

AREA

NORTHEAST

NORTHWEST

SOUTHEAST

SOUTHWEST

Price at Wellhead

MILES

75.25

138.21

129.45

150.64

GREAT LAKES CHLORIDE, INC

UNIT PRICE
PER MILE TOTAL PRICE
$1,168.95 $87,963.49
$1,168.95 $161,560.58
$1,168.95 $151,320.58
$1,168.95 $176,090.63

$0.759 per gallon

No pick up available

38% LIQUIDOW Calcium Chloride

7,000 gallon loads
min 100,000 gallons

MICHIGAN CHLORIDE

SALES LLC
UNIT PRICE

PER MILE TOTAL PRICE
No bid $0.00
No bid $0.00
No bid $0.00
No bid $0.00
$0.085 per gallon

St. Louis, MI

MINERAL WELL BRINE

only pick up available

On March 21, 2022, at 10:30 a.m.. the bids for the 2022 Dust Control were

opened.

At a Regular meeting of the Board of Eaton County Road Commissioners held on
March 22, 2022, the bid for 2022 Dust Control was awarded to Corrigan
Environmental Solutions.

CHLORIDE SOLUTIONS, LLC

UNIT PRICE
PER MILE TOTAL PRICE
$725.00 $54,556.25
$725.00 $100,202.25
$725.00 $93,851.25
$725.00 $109,214.00

$0.219 per gallon
North Branch &

Fowlerville

MINERAL WELL BRINE

9,500 gallon loads

CORRIGAN ENVIRONMENTAL

SOLUTIONS
UNIT PRICE
PER MILE TOTAL PRICE
$472.50 $35,555.63
$472.50 $65,304.23
$472.50 $61,165.13
$472.50 $71,177.40

$0.085 per gallon

Olivet

MINERAL WELL BRINE

8,500 gallon loads
Demurrage Charge: $115/hour



