
EATON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

PAVEMENT MARKING BID TABULATION

04/26/2021

ITEM # DESCRIPTION QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT UNIT PRICE AMOUNT

1 Waterborne Pavement Markings, 

yellow, 4-inch, centerline (solid and 

skip)

2,963,500 LINEAR 

FOOT

$0.046 $136,321.00 $0.053 $157,065.50 No Bid No Bid

2 Waterborne Pavement Markings, 

white, 4-inch, edge line

1,349,000 LINEAR 

FOOT

$0.045 $60,705.00 $0.051 $68,799.00 No Bid No Bid

3 Waterborne Pavement Markings, 

white, 4-inch, skip and solid lane 

line

76,300 LINEAR 

FOOT

$0.060 $4,578.00 $0.051 $3,891.30 No Bid No Bid

4 No Passing Zone Survey TBD MILE $100.000 $5.000 $250.00 min.

$201,604.00 $229,755.80 No Bid

On April 26, 2021, at 10:30 a.m.. the bids for the 2021 Pavement Markings were opened.

Blair E. Ballou, P.E.Engineer-Manager

EATON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

M & M PAVEMENT 

MARKING P. K. CONTRACTING, INC.

MICHIGAN PAVEMENT 

MARKINGS, LLC

At a Regular meeting of the Board of Eaton County Road Commissioners held on April 27, 2021, the bid for 

2021 Pavement Markings was awarded to _________________________.


