
EATON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

SEAL COAT  AGGREGATES BID TABULATION

Eaton County Road Commission

Seal Coat Aggregats

Bid Tabulation

Capitol 
Terminals

Carr 
Brothers &  
Sons, Inc.

Capitol 
Terminals

Carr 
Brothers &  
Sons, Inc.

Capitol 
Terminals

Carr Brothers 
&  Sons, Inc.

Capitol 
Terminals

Carr 
Brothers &  
Sons, Inc.

$ per Ton $ per Ton $ per Ton $ per Ton $ per Ton $ per Ton $ per Ton $ per Ton

SOUTHWEST

Charlotte Garage No Bid No Bid 31.22$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 31.22$        21.75$        

Cronk Pit No Bid No Bid 31.22$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 31.22$        21.43$        

Stine Pit No Bid No Bid 31.22$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 31.22$        21.75$        

NORTHWEST

Vermontville Garage No Bid No Bid 32.92$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.92$        26.25$        

NORTHEAST

Grand Ledge DPW Yard No Bid No Bid 31.22$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 31.22$        24.50$        

Delta Garage No Bid No Bid 31.22$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 31.22$        24.50$        

Hull Pit No Bid No Bid 31.22$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 31.22$        24.50$        

SOUTH EAST

Barnes Pit No Bid No Bid 31.22$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 31.22$        21.75$        

Five Point Pit No Bid No Bid 31.22$      No Bid No Bid No Bid 31.22$        21.75$        

MDOT 
Limestone

MDOT Chip 
Limestone

Natural 
Aggregates

Capitol Terminals alternate is Other

Carr Brothers & Sons, Inc alternate is 28B Modified 50-70% crushed

28B - Modified 29A 34CS - Modified
ALTERNATE Sealcoat 

Aggregate

On February 21, 2022 at 10:00 a.m., the bids for Sealcoat Aggregates were opened. At a regular meeting of the Board of Eaton County 
Road Commisisoners held on February 22, 2022 the Sealcoat Aggregates was awarded to Carr Brothers and Sons Inc.


