Eaton County Road Commission

2023 Seal Coat Aggregates

Bid Tabulation

ALTERNATE
ALTERNATE Sealcoat
34CS Trap CS-T Trap Sealcoat 34CS 34CS Trap CS-T Trap Aggregate
34CS Rock Rock Aggregate (Slag) Rock Rock (CST Slag)
Carr Brothers & Sons, Inc. Yellow Rose Transport
S per Ton $ per Ton S per Ton $ per Ton S per Ton $ per Ton S per Ton $ per Ton
SOUTHWEST
Charlotte Garage No Bid No Bid No Bid S 3250 $ 47.00| $ 52.00 | $ 60.15 | S 54.00
Cronk Pit No Bid No Bid No Bid S 29.43|$ 49.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 62.15| S 55.00
Stine Pit No Bid No Bid No Bid S 29.75 | $ 49.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 62.15| s 55.00
NORTHWEST
Vermontville Garage No Bid No Bid No Bid S 34.25| $ 46.00 | $ 51.00 | $ 59.15 | S 54.00
NORTHEAST
Grand Ledge DPW Yard No Bid No Bid No Bid S 32501 $ 47.00 | $ 52.00 | $ 60.15 | s 55.00
Delta Garage No Bid No Bid No Bid S 3250 | $ 47.00] $ 52.00 | $ 60.15 | S 55.00
Hull Pit No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 3250 $ 47.00| $ 52.00 | $ 60.15 | s 55.00
SOUTH EAST
Barnes Pit No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 29.75 | $ 49.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 62.00 | s 57.00
Five Point Pit No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 29.75 | $ 49.00 | $ 54.00 | $ 62.00 | s 57.00

Carr Brothers & Sons, Inc alternate is 28B Modified 50-70% crushed
Yellow Rose Transport altenate is CST Slag (as available)

On February 13, 2023 at 10:00 a.m., the bids for Seal Coat Aggregates were opened.

At a regular meeting of the Board of Eaton County Road Commisisoners held on March 14, 2023 the Sealcoat Aggregates contract was awarded to the

lowest bidder in each category.




