
Eaton County Road Commission
2024 Large Culvert Marterials
Bid Tabulation

ITEM QUANTITY UNIT
Poly Gauge Alum-2 Gauge Poly Alum-2

87" x 63" CMP Arch (Moore Road) 1 LSUM 13,299.00$     12 11,220.00$     12 No bid 9,174.00$       12

54" CMP Round (Bellevue Hwy) 1 LSUM 8,505.00$       16 7,425.00$       14 No bid 6,160.00$       14

66" CMP Round (Green Rd) 1 LSUM 12,809.00$     14 9,282.50$       14 No bid 6,780.00$       14

66" CMP Round (Cochran Rd) 1 LSUM 9,976.00$       14 7,955.00$       14 No bid 7,644.00$       14

42" CMP Round (Cochran Rd) 1 LSUM 3,596.00$       16 3,689.00$       14 No bid 3,410.00$       14

4-6 weeks 6-8 weeks 4-6 weeks

On August 26, 2024 the bids for the Large Culvert Materials were opened.  
At a regular meeting of the Board of Eaton County Road Commissioners held on August 27, 2024, the bids for the Large Culvert Materials were awarded as 
follows:

87" x  63" CMP Arch (Moore Road) 1 Polymer Culvert St. Regis
54" CMP Round (Bellevue Hwy) 1 Alum-2 Contech

66" CMP Round (Green) 1 Alum-2 Contech
66" CMP Round (Cochran Rd) 1 Alum-2 Contech
42" CMP Round (Cochran Rd) 1 Alum-2 Contech

Mathew Hannahs, P.E.
Engineer-Manager
Eaton County Road Commission

42" & 54" dia. - 2-2/3x1/2 
corrug.

54", 66", & 78" dia. - 3x1 
corrug.

42" dia. - not specified 
corrug.

54", 66", & 78" dia. - 3x1 
corrug.

42" dia. - not specified 
corrug.

ST REGIS
TOTAL PRICE

CONTECH
TOTAL PRICE

66" & 78" dia. - 5x1 
corrug.
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