

EATON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION
2025 Asphalt Emulsion

Bid Tabulation

	Michigan Paving & Materials Co.			Bit-Mat Products			Asphalt Materials Inc.		
	Job Site	Charlotte	ECRC Pick up	Job Site	Charlotte	ECRC Pick up	Job Site	Charlotte	ECRC Pick up
HFRS-2M	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CRS-2M	\$ 2.13	\$ 2.29	\$ 2.00	\$ 2.17	\$ 2.35	\$ 1.97	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CSS-1H	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CSEA	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CSS-1H Diluted	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CRS-2M Diluted	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
CQSEA	\$ 1.50	\$ 1.66	\$ 1.37	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1.57	\$ 1.66	\$ 1.35
Fast Set Fog Seal*	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 1.80	\$ 1.98	\$ 1.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

Michigan Paving & Materials Co. - Max. 3 hrs offload time, \$110/ hr over that time, Returned Freight - 1.5 times per gallon (\$350 min. charge), See attachments for freight tems, sales terms, and material return terms. See attached for ordering information. Min Load 9,000 gallons, Max Load 12,000 gallons.

Bit-Mat - Max. 3 hrs offload time, \$75/ half hr over that time, Returned Freight - 1.5 times outbound (\$200 min charge). Min Load 9,000 gallons, Max Load 10,000 gallons

Asphalt Materials - 1.5 times rate for Return. Min Load 5,600 gallons, Max Load 9,500 gallons.

On January 22nd, 2025 at 10:00 a.m., the bids for the 2025 Asphalt Emulsion were opened.

At a regular meeting of the Board of Eaton County Road Commisisoners held on January 28th, 2025 the Asphalt Emulsion bid was awarded to the lowest bidder in each category with the option to purchase from the second lowest bidderin each category if needed.