
Eaton County Road Commission
2025 Seal Coat Aggregates

Bid Tabulation
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SOUTHWEST
Charlotte Garage 36.75$     No Bid No Bid 33.50$         41.75$     No Bid No Bid 40.25$         54.50$     57.50$     66.50$     57.00$         
Cronk Pit 35.80$     No Bid No Bid 31.25$         41.75$     No Bid No Bid 40.25$         54.50$     57.50$     66.50$     57.00$         
Stine Pit 35.80$     No Bid No Bid 31.25$         42.00$     No Bid No Bid 40.50$         54.50$     57.50$     66.50$     57.00$         

NORTHWEST
Vermontville Garage 39.50$     No Bid No Bid 35.25$         40.00$     No Bid No Bid 38.50$         52.50$     55.50$     64.50$     55.00$         

NORTHEAST
Grand Ledge DPW Yard 38.50$     No Bid No Bid 34.00$         43.50$     No Bid No Bid 42.00$         52.50$     55.50$     64.50$     55.00$         
Delta Garage 38.50$     No Bid No Bid 34.00$         43.50$     No Bid No Bid 42.00$         52.50$     55.50$     64.50$     55.00$         
Hull Pit 38.50$     No Bid No Bid 34.00$         43.50$     No Bid No Bid 42.00$         52.50$     55.50$     64.50$     55.00$         

SOUTH EAST
Barnes Pit 35.80$     No Bid No Bid 31.25$         44.25$     No Bid No Bid 42.75$         54.50$     57.50$     66.50$     57.00$         
Five Point Pit 35.80$     No Bid No Bid 31.25$         43.50$     No Bid No Bid 42.00$         54.50$     57.50$     66.50$     57.00$         

Carr Brothers & Sons, Inc bid an alternate: 28B Modified (50-80% crushed).
Gale Briggs Inc bid an alternate: 28B Modified (50-80% crushed).

On February 19, 2025 at 10:00 a.m., the bids for Seal Coat Aggregates were opened. Yellow Rose Transport bid an alternate of CST Slag (as available)

Carr Brothers &  Sons, Inc. Yellow Rose Transport

At a regular meeting of the Board of Eaton County Road Commissioners held on February 25, 2025 the Sealcoat Aggregates were awarded to 
the lowest bidder in each category that can produce the material that will meet specifications.

Gale Briggs Inc.






