
EATON COUNTY ROAD COMMISSION

2026 AGGREGATE SURFACE COURSE AND MAINTENANCE GRAVEL

BID TABULATION

Approx. 
Quantity

Job Site Delivery 
(ECRC 

Placement)

Delivery 
and 

Placement 

Job Site Delivery 
(ECRC 

Placement)

Delivery 
and 

Placement 

Job Site Delivery 
(ECRC 

Placement)

Delivery 
and 

Placement 

Job Site Delivery 
(ECRC 

Placement)

Delivery 
and 

Placement 

Job Site Delivery 
(ECRC 

Placement)

Delivery 
and 

Placement 

Bellevue Township $/CYD 5,028 $22.25 NO BID $22.00 $23.50 $25.13 NO BID NO BID $25.45 $24.00 $28.00

Benton Township $/CYD 5,496 $22.25 NO BID $32.00 $34.50 $28.21 NO BID NO BID $28.00 $28.00 $32.00

Brookfield Township $/CYD 9,600 $22.25 NO BID $21.00 $23.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.30 $25.00 $28.00

Carmel Township $/CYD 7,498 $22.25 NO BID $26.00 $28.50 $25.58 NO BID NO BID $25.50 $27.00 $31.00

Chester Township $/CYD 6,162 $21.25 NO BID $29.00 $32.50 $27.28 NO BID NO BID $30.00 $27.00 $31.00

Delta Township $/CYD 5,004 $22.25 NO BID $35.00 $38.50 $28.06 NO BID NO BID $31.00 $29.00 $33.00

Eaton Township $/CYD 2,496 $22.25 NO BID $23.00 $25.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.85 $29.00 $32.00

Eaton Rapids Township $/CYD 7,440 $22.25 NO BID $23.00 $25.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID $25.85 $28.00 $32.00

Hamlin Township $/CYD 8,430 $22.25 NO BID $20.50 $23.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.30 $25.00 $28.00

Kalamo Township $/CYD 7,572 $22.25 NO BID $28.00 $30.50 $25.19 NO BID NO BID $26.35 $27.00 $31.00

Oneida Township $/CYD 3,636 $22.25 NO BID $35.00 $38.50 $28.83 NO BID NO BID $33.00 $28.00 $32.00

Roxand Township $/CYD 6,330 $21.25 NO BID $39.00 $42.50 $29.06 NO BID NO BID $33.00 $27.00 $31.00

Sunfield Township $/CYD 4,644 $21.25 NO BID $39.00 $42.50 $27.13 NO BID NO BID $33.00 $27.00 $31.00

Vermontville Township $/CYD 5,172 $21.25 NO BID $28.00 $30.50 $25.58 NO BID NO BID $30.50 $27.00 $31.00

Walton Township $/CYD 10,380 $22.25 NO BID $21.50 $23.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID $26.90 $23.00 $27.75

Windsor Township $/CYD 6,240 $22.25 NO BID $35.00 $38.50 $29.06 NO BID NO BID $32.00 $30.00 $33.00

Maintenance Gravel

Charlotte Garage $/CYD

Delta Garage $/CYD

Vermontville Garage $/CYD

Pro Grade Excavating submitted a bid for placement only. This does not meet the specifications for this bid

On February 2, 2026, at 10:00 a.m. the bids for the 2026 Aggregate Surface Course and Maintenance Gravel were opened.

At a Regular meeting of the Board of Eaton County Road Commissioners held February 24th, 2026 Aggregate Surface Course and Maintenance Gravel was Awarded to the lowest bidder in  
each township with the option to purchase from the second low bidder if the low bidder is unable to furnish the material. 

$29.00

$25.00

Carr Brothers & Sons, Inc.T. Briggs Trucking, LLC.

$25.58 $24.40

$21.75

$22.00

Stoneco Schlegel Sand & Gravel

$24.90

$24.90

Xact Excavating LLC

$26.00$22.00

$23.50

$23.50

$26.74

$21.50

$28.06


